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ABSTRACT

In recent years, considerable attention has been given to
studies on the role of playlists in music consumption. A
study carried out in 2016, by the Music Business Associa-
tion [6], showed that playlists accounted for 31% of music
listening time among listeners in the USA. Another study,
conducted by MIDiA [1], revealed that as many as 55% of
streaming music service subscribers create playlists. Ac-
cordingly, music streaming services such as Spotify cur-
rently host over 2 billion playlists [9]. This evidence may
indicate the growing importance of playlists as a mode for
music consumption, and indeed the crucial necessity of de-
veloping algorithms for automatic playlist continuation,
which is the focus of the ACM Recommender Systems
Challenge 2018 [7]. In this paper, we — the organization
team of this challenge — briefly discuss the particular task
we defined for the participating teams. We also provide
some information on the overall Challenge process.

ACM Recommender Systems Challenge
The Recommender Systems Challenge is a yearly com-
petition focusing on creating the best-performing recom-
mendation approach for a specific task and a specific sce-
nario. From 2010 to 2017, the competition has drawn di-
verse participants from academia and industry [10,11,15].
Today, the Recommender Systems Challenge has become
a key part of the ACM Conference on Recommender Sys-
tems series, the leading conference in recommender sys-
tems research. The Recommender Systems Challenge has
followed a similar structure since its inception: (1) a real-
world problem is presented with a corresponding dataset,
(2) researchers and developers form teams and sign up for
participation, (3) participating teams submit their solutions
prior to a deadline, (4) top participating teams submit pa-
pers that outline their approaches, (5) during a workshop
at the ACM RecSys conference, accepted papers are pre-
sented and the winning teams are announced.
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In MIREX, a few attempts to launch music recommen-
dation [3] or personalized radio stationing [4] tasks were
performed in the past, but they were never realized to the
best of the authors’ knowledge. In comparison, by orga-
nizing the task in 2018 at the ACM Recommender Sys-
tems conference, we will reach a broader audience and
with the full support of a major music streaming company,
Spotify, we are sure to attract a remarkable number of par-
ticipants. The MIREX task probably closest to ours is the
Audio Music Similarity and Retrieval task [5], which has
been run in 2016 for the last time. However, the organiz-
ers explicitly state that the task is “not playlist generation
or music recommendation”, rather pure similarity aspects.
Another related challenge was the Million Song Dataset
Challenge [2], which featured a traditional recommenda-
tion task: based on a part of the user’s listening history,
another, withheld part needed to be predicted. In contrast,
our task explicitly considers hand-curated playlists, not lis-
tening histories.

Automatic Playlist Continuation
The task for the Recommender Systems Challenge in 2018
will be automatic playlist continuation (APC). This task
consists of adding one or more tracks to a music playlist (of
arbitrary length) in a way that fits the target characteristics
of the original playlist [12,16]. APC is a useful feature for
music streaming services not only because it can extend
listening session length, but also because it can increase
engagement of users on their platform by making it easier
for users to create playlists that they can enjoy and share.

As part of this challenge, Spotify will be releasing a
public dataset of roughly 1 million user-created playlists.
The dataset will include the title of each playlist, as well as
the list of tracks, and some associated metadata, for each
playlist. A separate evaluation set will consist of a set of
playlists from which a number of tracks have been with-
held. The task will then be to predict the missing tracks in
those playlists, and participating teams will be required to
submit their predictions for those missing tracks. An ap-
propriate accuracy metric will be defined, which will then
be used to evaluate the performance of each of the submis-
sions.

The dataset and associated evaluation metrics are sched-
uled to be released by the end of 2017. Up-to-date infor-
mation can be found on the Challenge website. 1

1 http://2018.recsyschallenge.com



Current Challenges
Limitations of current research in APC, which will be im-
portant to address by participants of the challenge, are
manifold and briefly summarized in the following. While
some work on APC highlights the special characteristics
of playlists, i.e., their sequential order, it is not well un-
derstood to which extent and in which cases taking into
account the order of tracks in playlists helps create better
models for recommendation. For instance, in [18] Vall et
al. recently demonstrated on two datasets of hand-curated
playlists that the song order seems to be negligible for ac-
curate playlist continuation when a lot of popular songs
are present. On the other hand, the authors argue that or-
der does matter when creating playlists with tracks from
the long tail. Another study by McFee and Lanckriet [14]
also suggests that transition effects play an important role
in modeling playlist continuity. In another recent user
study [17] conducted by Tintarev et al., the authors find
that many listeners do not care about the order of tracks in
recommended playlists, sometimes they do not even notice
that there is a particular order. However, this study was re-
stricted to 20 participants who used the Discover Weekly
service of Spotify [8].

Another challenge for the APC task is the high subjec-
tivity of what makes a great playlist [13], including factors
such as intent of the creator or listener. Important crite-
ria when creating or judging a playlist include track sim-
ilarity/coherence, variety/diversity, but also the user’s per-
sonal preferences and familiarity with the tracks, as well as
the intention of the playlist creator. Unfortunately, current
automatic approaches to APC are agnostic of the under-
lying psychological and sociological factors that influence
the decision of which songs users choose to include in a
playlist. Since knowing about such factors is vital to under-
stand the intent of the playlist creator, we believe that algo-
rithmic methods for APC need to learn such aspects from
manually created playlists and integrate respective intent
models. However, we are aware that in today’s era where
billions of playlists are shared by users of online streaming
services [9], a large-scale analysis of psychological and so-
ciological background factors is impossible. Nevertheless,
in the absence of explicit information about user intent, a
possible starting point to create intent models might be the
metadata associated with user-generated playlists, such as
the title and the list of tracks.

Conclusion
This paper briefly investigated the growing importance,
as well as remaining challenges, of the automatic music
playlist continuation task. The authors, who are the orga-
nizers of the Recommender Systems Challenge 2018, de-
cided to focus on this particular, real-world problem of the
music industry and they are currently preparing the details
of the actual task.
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